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Originally from Kansas, Tim Bauer, started his career in 
teaching internationally in Asia, but decided to follow a 
personal dream and came to Vancouver to study illustration. 
He is the illustrator and creator behind Woahman Comics, 
and some of his influences and inspirations come from 
comic books, old 80’s cartoons, Hong Kong action theatre, 
fashion illustration, Sci-fi movies, and drag queens.

In 2017 and 2018 Tim was short-listed for the Broken 
Pencil Zine awards. He has also been the featured artist 
for SADmag in August of 2019. He is currently an artist in 
residence at a local elementary school where he creates art 
projects with the students.

He is also a fan of people that have the courage to blur 
gender in their fashion and artwork, which has inspired him 
to create “campy” comics. In most of Tim’s work he has 
been experimenting with interactive elements including 
anaglyph 3d prints of his comics (aka 3d comics –the ones 
with the red and blue lenses). Since 2015, Tim has been 
making a new zines that gives off a vintage, psychedelic, 
campy, and queer tone. Among other things, he is recently 
finished a 52 page comic for a Korean haunted tour 
company called “The Dark Side of Seoul” that features 
Korean ghost tales in April 2020.


